-~
il

LB

-
et

N 3N "3 ">

N

- -

i
-

. -

A N A2 ) ) W)

e

N Nor N Bt N N

A AT S T s

7

= g Regd. No. 8270

Reg:stered w:th the Reg:strm
of Newspapers for Indla

L&A um@m INTASHD
LA-GAZETTE DE LETAT DE PONDICHERY
THE GAZETTE OF PONDICHERRY ’

PART-I1
Fipuy Geefld® EXTRAORDINAIRE EXTRAORDINARY
NP sTod QuHn Publiée par ~ Published by

: QeI Autorité Authority
1 oewev: ep. 1-25 Prix: Rs: 1425 Price: Rs. 1=25
‘ GY6RT 1§ N Feaildbd 1pen 1o 1993@m* Gio 16" 1 e
No. |18 Pondichéry Samedi 1 Mai = 1993
Saturday 1st May 1992

No. Pondicherry
: (11 Vaisakha 1915)

-

GOVERNMENT OF PONDICHERRY
CHIEF SECRETARIAT (Transport) =i
[G. O. Ms. No. 25/93-Wel. (T1.), dated 27th April 1993]

NOTIFICATION

In exercise of the powers conferred by sections 28, 38, 65,
95, 96, 107, 111, 138 and 176 of the Motor Vehicles Act, 1988
'(Central Act 59 of 1988), the Administrator, Pondicherry,
hereby "makes the following amendment to the Pondicherry
Motor Vehicles Rules, 1989 the Draft of the same having
been pre-published in the notification issued iIn
G. O. Ms. No. 48/92-Wel. (Tr.), dated 9th November 1992 of
the Chief Secretariat (Transpoit), Pondicherry and published m

[103]




104 LA GAZETTE DE LETAT = [ParrlIl

the - Extravrdinary - Gazéette, Part-II,” No. 28, dated 18th

November 1992 as required under sub-section (1) of section 212
of the said Act and the objections and suggestions receivel
in response thereto having been considered, namely :—

I. Short title and é'ommencement.—(l) These rules may be
called the Pondicherry Motor Vehicles (Amendment) Rules, 1993.

(2) They shall come into force on and from the date of
their publication in the official gazette.

2. Amendment to rule 32.—In rule 32 of the Pondicherry
_Motor Vehicles Rules, 1989 (hereinafter referred to as the
said rules), for sub-rule (1), the following shall be substituted,
namely . —

32, Temporary Registration.—(1) An application for
grant. of temporary registration shall be made to the
registering authority in Form C.R. TEM. A— . '

(i) along with a fee of rupees thirty, where the temporary
registration is sought in respect of a motor-cycle; and

o

(ii) along with a fee of rupees fifty, where the
‘temporsry registration is sought in respect of any other
motor vehicle other than a mo'or-cycle.”.

= 3. -Amendment of rule 36.—'n the sub-rule (1) of rule 36
of the said rules, for the words “two rupees’”, the words
“twenty-five rupees’’ shall be substituted.

4. Insertion of a new rule S1A.—In the said rules, after
- rule 51, the following rule shall be inserted, namely :—

“S1A. Exemption from payment of fee.—Notwithstanding
anything contained .in this chapter, the depariment of the
Central and State Governments and Union Territory Admin-
istration are exempted from payment of all fees payable
under this chaptcr in respect of applications, issue of renewal
Of certificates or amendment of documents or for any purpose
or matter mvolvtng rendering of any service by ofﬁcers or

authorities under this chapter.”.

/




7 i"ART-Ii ]' e GAZETTE DB, .L’BTAT- usser -« 1103

¥ Amemlmmt of ‘rule 63. —(1) In sub-rule (l) of - rulc 63
of the said rules,—

(a) in the entries against item (i), for the figures ¢ 6007,
the figures “2000” shall be substituted ;

(b) in the entries agamst item (ii), for the ﬁgurcs * 200,
the figures “1000” shall be substituted ;

() 1in the entries against item (iii). for the fgures *350%;
| the figures “1000” shall be -substitu S L

(d) in the entries against item (iv), for the ﬁgures “100,
' the figures *500”" shall be substituted ;

(e) in the entries agamst item (v), for the figures ‘100",
the ﬁgurcs 500 sball be subsrituted ;

(f) in the entries against item (vi), for the figures 100",
the figures “500” shall be substttured

(g) * in the entries against item (vii). for the figures 100",
the figures **500’° shall be substituted ;

(h) in the entries against item (viii). for the figures “100”,
the figures “500”’~ shall be substituted ;

(i) in the entries against item (ix), for the figures 1007,
the figures *300" shall be subst:’tured :

() “in the entries against item(x). for the ﬁgures 50°,
the figures “300” shall be substituted :

(2) in sub-rule (2) of rule’ 63-of ,the said rules,;'

(a) in the eatries against item (i), for the figures <507,
- the figures “300” shall be substituted ;

(b) for the item (ii), the following shall be substituted,
namely . — :

“(if) For the grant of Contract Carriage

Permit other than Tourist Taxi/
Autorickshaw . SO0

(c) in the entries against item (i), for the figures €25,
the figures “150°° shall be substituted ;




4 gy

106 - LA GAZETTE DE L'ETAT [-PART-II‘,‘__M_,»

..(d) for the item (iv), the followmg shall be subsututed
- namely ; |

-

“(iv) For the rencwal of Contract Carriage Permit

other than Tourist TaxijAutorickshaw ..250";

(e)  in the entries against item (v), for the figures “100",
- .the figures “300™ shall be substituted ;

tries dgam';t ltem (v1) far the figures “1007,

RS

-

=]

[T

ares—<3002—shalt—b= sumnmzecz 4

»

(g) in the entries against item (vii), for the figures “100”,
thc figures 300 shall be substituted,

(h) for the item (viii), the following shall be substituted,
namely:— :

“(viil) For issue of special permits for
a period not more than 7days .. 507;

(i) for the item (ix), the following shall be substituted,
namely:—

“(1x) For issue of special perrmts for
a penod more than 7 days -+ > JOO™;

(3) In subrule (3) of rule 63 of the said rules, for

. the words “two hundred rupees” and ‘“one hundred rupees”,

the words “one thousand rup:es” and “five hundred rupees”
shall be respectively substituted, :

(4) TIn subrule (4) of rule 63 of the said rules, for the
existing entries against items (i), (u) and (1'1), the tollowing
shall be substituted, namely——

i) for not more than 7 days RO o R

(i) -for more than 7 days- but not
. ~more than 1 month I . TR

- (ii1) for more than 1 month but not
more than 4 moanths s - s JOH e

don D

ARV S e
S N’

Wiy

1& -

wr

L"‘) \

s

\o




» | | -
§ r-IL | Parrdl] LA GAZETTE DE L’ETAT 107
? ) (5) For sub-rule (3) of rule - 63 of the - said -rules, the -
9 o following shall be substttuted namely:—
& ] ) “(5) The fee in respect ~of an application for
—PO" replacement of a vebicle covered by a stage
3._ IS carilage permit shall be,—— :
& Ry e : ;
O (i) in case not involving any
§ O variation Rs. 250
2 )\L\. (i) —incase involving varlaton Rs. 500”°; and
B} |
& : : ®
fgjﬂ’,_ (6) After the sud-ruic (5) of rule 63 of the said ruoles,
O the following sub-rule shall be inserfed. rpamely:—
(DL
d,( “(6) The fees in respect of any cther services not
i = ~covered - in Lge 3boivc salld provisions shall be
" ~rupees one hundred only
i O
‘)% (1 6. Imsertion of a new rule 65A.—In the said rules, afrer
) rule 65, the foliowing rule shall be inserted, namely:—
a0 o
‘)‘ { < “65A. Stage carriage jixing schedule of “timing.— (1) - The
¢ )§ : ’; State Transport Auihority may, il no schedule of timings
EL o is already fixed or approved for a stage currlage or the
) : {S Servicss of stage carriages on any route either on its own
3 motion or on an apphcatlon made to it in writing, . by
Jor, a general or special order, fix and approve a-schedule of
= timings, for the particular stage carriage or the services
b & g of stage carriages in consultation with the applicant and
i1 Q the persons providing transport facilities on the route or
23 ‘ sectors thereof and while appioving a schedule of timing
)1 <4 on an application mace to it, in writing, it may approve th\.
&4 i scheme with such modifications as it may deem necessary.
jb . It shall not be recessary for the State Transport Authority
i 5 to send individual notice of the timings confereace to the
i3 Y operators concerned and it shall be sufficient compliance,
E g if a notice giving the existing and proposed schedule of
2 = . timings and the time, date and placeat which the subject
o | will be discussed, is affixed on the notice-board of the
D Office of the State Transport Authomy and copies of the noticc
i sent to the applicant, the concerned State Transport Under-
4)’ 3 taking and Bus Owners Association of the District through
—he 3 hich the route passes:
) &
)



108 LA GAZETIE DE LETAT - [PaRT-II

Provided that in the case of mtthwn of tthJg
carriages  of State _Transport : or temporary
permit, te tentatm, fimings may_be fixed by the State Transport
Authority - wthout followmg thc procedure laid  down 1 m
“the sub-rule. =

(2) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-rule (1),
the State Transport Authority may, at any time either
on its own motion or on an application made to it in writing,
if satisfied of the expediency, revise or modify any schedule
_of timings already fixed or approved for any particular

—— p——
[l

P
e

i
k.

4 P e

stage —carriage 0T any SCrvice of Stage carriage on any route
or portion thercof after following the procedure laid down
in sub-rule (1).

(3) Bvery application made to the State Transport
Authority for fixation, modification or revision of schedule
of timing shall be accompanied by a fee of rupees one
thousand only:

Provnded that if the State Transport Authonty revises or
modifies any schedule of timing already fixed in respect of
a stage carriage on its own motion or consequent on fixation
or revision of schedule of timings of some other services of
slage carriages, the permit holder need not pay any fee
for such revision or modification.”.

7. Awmendment of rule 70.—In rule 70 of the said rules, after the
words “No owner of a motor vehicle adapted to carry more
than nine passengers’”, the words ‘‘unless otherwise exempted
by the Government of Pondicherry” shall be inserted.

8. Insertion of a new rule 77A.—In the said rules, after
rule 77, the following rule shall be inserted, namely :—

“77A. Procedure on surrender of permit.—(1) (a) If the
holder of a permit proposes to surrender the primary permit
or counter-signature of permit for cancellation, he shall
make an application in Form P. S. A. to the State Transport
Authority concerned for the acceptance of surrender of the
permit.

- (b) Such application shall be accompanied by the permit
and a fee of rupees fifty.

(2) @), In case where the holder of the permit has
no liabilities outstanding or where there is sufficient
documentary evidence to prove that the liabilities have




? e

$ b
2o
2 |ort

i()
) [y
(D11 .
: her
2@

ule
2 la()

PArT-11] - LA GAZETTE DE L’ETAT 109

been cleared by the parmit holder concerned, the State
Transport Authority shall direct the permit holder to produce
the certificate of registration of the vehicle.

(b) On receipt of the records referred to in clause (a),
the State Transport Authority, or the Secretary of the
State Transport Authority if authorjsed in this behalf by
the State Transport Authority shall forthwith cancel the
permit so surrendered or cancel the endorsement for payment
of tax in the certificate of registration.

(3) In case the holder of the permit—has—tiabilities—

oufstanding or there are disciplinary proceedings pending
against him or there are orders in force suspending or
cancelling ths permit, the State Transport  Authority shall
summarily reject the application for surrender of permit
unless sufficient evidence is not furnished within 30 days
of the date of application regarding clearing the liabilities
or having undergone the disciplinary proceedings or the
suspension period of modification.of the order on appeal or
having paid a certain- sum of money in lieu of cancellation
or suspension of the permit.”

9. Amendment of rale 78.—In the said rules, in sub-tule (5)
of rule 78,— ; '

() in clause (i), for the words ‘ one thousand rupees
in respect of stage carriages and contract carriages and
one hundred rupees in respect of goods carriages”, the
words ““two thousand rupees in respect of stage carriages and
contract carriages except autorickshaws. Two hundred
and fifty rupees in respect of autorickshaws and five hundred
rupees in respect of goods carriages’ shall be substituted; and

(2) in clause (v), for the words “fifty rupees”, the words
“ five hundred rupees” shall be substituted.

10. Amendment of rule 79.—In rulz 79 of the said rules,
in sub-rule (2) and sub-rule (5), for the words *‘ twenty rupees’
wherever thev occur, the words “one hundred rupees” shall
be substituted.

11. Amendment of rule 80.—In the said rules, in sub-rule (5)
of rule 80, for the words *“seven rupees” and “two rupees”
wherever they occur, the words “ one hundred rupees” shall be
substituted.




¥ %

110 - .LA GAZETTE DE LETAT [PAR’I_‘-II

1
At

_ 12. Amendment of “rule 81 —ln rule 8] of thc bdld rulcs, {}
for sub rule (3), the following shall be substituted, namely, { 1
“(3) Tlic fee payable in cach case for the variation of
permit or any conadition thercof regarding revision and i
= consequential change of timings, revision of timings with 1
variation or extension of permit, revision of timings involving -
curtailment and in any other c¢ase shall be rupees one 4
thousand.” : -
; 13. Amendment of rule 84.—In rule 84 of the said rules, M
5 in sub-rule (1), for the words “one hundred und fifty rupees’, .
5 the words ‘‘five hundred rupecs™ shall be substituted.
14. Insertica of sub-rule in rule $9.—In the said tules, after (Y
sub-rule (2) of rule 99 the following shall be inserted, namely :— £
.
{_-l
— “(3) The fee payable for cfecting the chdnge of address i
in the permit shall be one hundred rupees.’ ;-
] | ' . '
i| 15. Amendment of rule 100.—In the said rules, in sub-rule (1) “
{ ol rule 100, after thie words “‘report in writing”, the words v
i “together with a fec of twenty-five rupees’ shall be inserted. )
’g 16. - Amendment of rule 101.—In the said rules, in sub-rule (1) -
i of rule 101, after the words ‘‘as required by the said section”, ~
the words “‘together with a fee of one hundred rupees” .shall )
be inserted. : :
. (3
17. Amendment of rule 122.—In the said rules, affer >
sub-rule (5) of rule 122, the following shall be inserted as
sub-rules'(6) and (7), namely : -— )
“(6) Stage carriages permitted to be operated in the areas
declared as urban areas by ihe Government from time to time )
shall have stainless steel colour body with one sigral red band
of 30 centimetres around the bodv and with th\. top portion )
above the window painted in signal red colour; and )
(7) The buses owned by a college, school or other %

educational institution and uscd colsly for the purpose of

transport of students and staff of the educational institution
shall be painted in yellow colour.”




U\.«V

|

PART-II] | LA GAZETTE DE L’ETAT 111

SR A g iRt > SRR R T TR

: 18. Amendment to rule 190.—In the said rules, in the Table
below rule 190,— -

vwigee s ¢

(i) against serial No. 2, for the figures “150”, the figures **500”
* shall be substituted; and
v?e(ufli = : (ii) against serial No.3, for the figures “150”, the figures
e .F o ““1000” shall be substituted.
o(q)e s 19. Tnsertion of rule 201A.—After rule 201 of the said rules,
f the following shall be inserted, namely .
S ' “201A. Prohibition of smoking.— No_driver—ofeonductor—
——mf:llef" — of a stage carriage or contract carriage sha'l smoke or
) CS, : allow any passenger to smoke inside the vehicle and the words
BT -‘No smoking’ shall invariably be written in the vehicles.”
20. TInsertion of Form P.S.A.—After Form P, Rep A
vjfw : the following form shall be inserted, namely :
(’”r ;
‘E e St : “‘F-ORM_ P.S A.
)_;:r ) L e . (See rule 77A)

e Application for surrender of primary permit/counter-signature
)s{ « )’ 7 _ of permit
)’ods To
bd( - The Secretary,

' .)f. . State Transport Authority.
) (1) = : Sir,

}?én I/We propose to surrender the state carriage/goods
) carriage/contract carrige permit in respect of my/our
) fe _ vechicle and request that a clearance certificate may be.
2 1 granted to me/us.

o
~ ﬂgl I/We give below the necessary particulars ;| —

} 1 : : ;

4 As it - 1. Full name and address of the permit

holder (in Block Letters)

)’ﬁrg 2. Registration mark of the vehicle

i ) covered by the permit

)1on 3. Anuthority by which the permit was

} { issued -

,hf‘:‘r ; 4. Number of the permit and the date
A ir’ : of 1ssue i

jio[ri' 5. Route or area for which the permit

= : 1s valid
-“ —ﬂm—-ﬂ- -



| - : d

== 112 LA -GAZETTE' DE L’ETAT [ PART-1I (.
e e e SRR e e e e S R e S : 3

6. Goods which the vehicle is germ:ttcd :

" to carry (in case of goods carriage) .. (;

7. (a) Passenger capacity [in case of a 5

stage carriage] s ;":

(b) Big, medium, baby, tourist or r

luxury coach [in the case of a =

contract carriage] ¥

8. Date of expiry of the permit 5

9. (a) Place[s] at which the business is/ \*‘

was carried on

(b) Place where the vehicle may be "‘

= found for inspection €
10. Reasons for surrender of the permit <
(state briefly) ’ ¢
' | 25
| L
I/We enclose .. .. .. .. .. ..cash/chalan/cheque/money 3)
order receipt of Rs. .. .. being the prescribed fee.
| - Y
I/We enclose the permit of the vehicle. /
I/We will produce the certificate of registration of P

the vehicle on receipt of further intimation. &

I/We declare that to the best of my/our knowledge :

~and belief, the information furnished in the application -

i1s correct, complete and is truly stated. -3

J

¥,

1)

Place: )

= Date Signature of the applicant.” )
e



'l = "‘-(J%_

PART-I1 ]- LA GAZETTE DE LETAT 113

A R AT R ATV S ey G Eari e AWk et -

”1 Amendment of Form P. Tr A, -—In Form P. Tr A.

appénded to the said rules, Jor item 1, the following shall be
substituted, namely : : :

“l. The transferor is an existing stage carriage/contract
carriage operator and wants .to transfer one of his/her
permt Deartp Blos . oo s i i e iy seoes TOE LD
reason for the such proposed transfer to be stated)

. «+ Ihe wvehicle

B HRTTOIE .. .. - < - s oas s iy b A e

(By order of the Administrator) .

S. PALANISAMY,
Under Secretary to Government (Tr.).’

Government Press (C)
Directorate of Stationery and Printing
PONDICHERRY -9



